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Join us for an unforgettable 
Sup trip in the Ligurian 
Riviera and 5 Terre national 
Park.

Idyllic villages, fine regional 
food and wine, the most 
outstanding stretch of coast   
Unesco World Heritage.

Liguria is well known for 
vineyards, terraces and stone 
walls , picture perfect towns 
and crystal clear  water 

backdropped with dramatic 
cliffs.

You are traveling in one of 
the most beautiful regions  
where our local and expert 
guides will lead you safely on 
the way of culture, history , 
sounds and taste.This trip 
from the water perspective 
delivers something really 
unique and off the beaten 
track.


The trip includes :

- Genova , the superba 
Unesco world heritage 

- Food and wine experience

-  The  5 legendary  villages 

Unesco World heritage  

- Portovenere  


Pick Up : Genova

Drop Off :La Spezia/ Genoa  

Departures guaranteed with 
4 guests march to November 

SUP THE RIVIERA AND 5 TERRE 

Spring / Summer / Fall 2024  Small Groups ( 4 to 8)

7 days / 6 nights trip guest house based 

http://kayakxplore.com

